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Shakira had an unex-
pected — and unwanted —
visitor in the wee hours of
Monday morning at her
Miami Beach mansion.
According to an arrest

report from the Miami
Beach Police Department,
an officer responded to the
pop star’s North Bay Road
mansion around midnight

after Daniel
Valtier, 56,
showed up
via taxi at
her door.
The offi-

cer made
contact with
the cab
driver, who
said Valtier,
of El Paso,
Texas, did
not pay the
$70.06
fare.
Valtier

stated he
“he did not
have the
money or

the intention of paying the
fare,” says the affidavit,
and that the “person who
lived at the listed location
was supposed to pay.”
It’s unclear if Shakira or

her two young sons were
at home at the time.
The suspect then at-

tempted to charge the ride
to his debit card, but the
transaction was declined.
The cab driver said he

wanted to press charges
and the defendant was

placed under arrest for
hiring a vehicle with intent
to defraud and transported
to the Turner Guilford
Knight Correctional Cen-
ter.
It turns out the non-

paying passenger was also
Shakira’s alleged stalker. A
separate MBPD police
report says that for weeks
leading up to the visit he
had been sending Shakira
packages containing gifts
such as wine, chocolate
and toys, as well as letters
and other items.
The suspect also alleged-

ly wrote on social media
that he was “married” to
Shakira and they planned
on opening a trucking busi-
ness and a “worldwide”
garmentmanufacturing
corporation together.
On Jan. 3, after Valtier

posted a picture of a busi-
ness card from the Rode-
way Inn in Bonifay, Florida,
roughly 500miles from
Miami Beach, the pop star’s
“alarmed” security team
alerted authorities.
At the police station,

Valtier invoked hisMiranda
Rights but was subsequent-
ly slapped with an addition-
al charge of stalking.
Valtier appeared in

Miami-Dade bond court
Tuesday. The judge or-
dered him to stay away
from Shakira. He re-
mained behind bars on
$100,000 bond.
He was also fined

$2,500 on the taxi charge.
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pandemic because it was
one of the few sports that
people could enjoy out-
doors. As of 2022, Florida
had 2,854 pickleball
courts, the second-highest
number in the country,
according to USA Pickle-
ball, an organization cre-
ated in 2005.
The sport is most pop-

ular among people aged
65 and over but has seen
increased interest among
younger ages, according to
USA Pickleball. Fort Lau-
derdale’s 65-and-older
community comprises
19.3% of its population,
according to the U.S. Cen-
sus.
Tuckman said the goal

is for the park to be open
by mid-December, in time
for a Association of
Pickleball Players event in
Fort Lauderdale from Dec.
11-15.

BUILDING THE FORT
Snyder Park sits north of

Fort
Lauderdale-Hollywood
International Airport and
includes a nature trail,
basketball courts and a
dog park on 91 acres.
Tuckman said the area

of the park where the
pickleball courts will go
was once a quarry where
stone was excavated for
construction around the
city in the early 1900s.

Parts of it later became a
lake. He said the city also
once used the area to store
seaweed and trucks.
“It’d be like a back

house for the city where
they had a garbage trans-
fer station also,” he said.
“We’re going to reutilize
all the seaweed that has
been stored there for the
last 15 to 20 years, and
we’re going to actually
utilize that dirt again.”
Other plans for that sec-
tion of the park include
revitalizing a seven-acre
lake and making it swim-
mable again.
The Fort will also have a

lakehouse.
“While pickleball is the

centerpiece here, what
we’re doing with the lake
is really going to be spe-
cial because it’s going to
provide a place and a
community for people to
go in and literally hang
out and enjoy themselves
while they eat and drink,”
Tuckman said.
The facility will also

have a pro shop, locker
room and 4,000-square-
foot event center that can
cater to small events and
will offer free access to
neighborhood associations
to host their meetings.
Tuckman also noted there
will be green space for
activities such as yoga.
“We’re also going to be

a place where people
come from all over the
country to train,” Tuck-
man said. “People come
from all over the country

to come down and play
tennis. People are going to
come from all over the
country to train with us
and then you really think
about it from a tourism
perspective. The tourism
for pickleball is huge right
now as well. So, we’re
expecting that throughout
the year.”
Plans to bring the facil-

ity to Fort Lauderdale
have been met with resist-
ance, with petitions to
maintain Snyder Park and
the green space near
where The Fort will be
built. But Tuckman said
the pickleball courts won’t
interfere with the other

aspects of the park.
“I think the biggest

misconception is that we
just came in to steal land
and do something, when
in reality, we actually
approached the city be-
cause we wanted to build
something that was good
for the whole communi-
ty,” he said.
Still, Tuckman said he

has been receptive to
criticism, including wor-
ries about increased foot
traffic, removing a small
beach, upending green-
space and pickleball noise.
While initial plans called
for partial removal of the
beach, Tuckman said the
site will keep a third of the
beach and will restore it.
Berms have also been
added to quell pickleball
noise.
“We’re going to do our

best to be good neighbors,
and we believe that we’re
going to actually revitalize
that part of the park and
bring people to the park,”
he said.
“I just can’t make peo-

ple like us, but I’m gonna
do my best to do a good
job to provide a good
place for everybody.”
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A lakehouse will be added to Fort Lauderdale’s Snyder Park.
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