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connections at the pool
deck and lobby levels of
Champlain Towers South
and then simulating corro-
sion of the reinforcing
steel bars and testing
them to understand their
strength.
More than $33 million

has been spent on the
investigation so far, offi-
cials said.
Pablo Langesfeld,

whose daughter and son-
in-law died in the collapse,
said the delays were dis-
appointing.
“We don’t need more

hypotheses. We need solid
and concrete answers,”
Langesfeld said during the
meeting. “We need an-
swers now.”
Two years ago, investi-

gators said they were on
track to release their draft
report in 2025. That was
still the case in an update
this past March.
But Mitrani-Reiser said

last week that the team’s
technical work likely
won’t be completed until
May 2025, with a draft
report anticipated in the
spring of 2026. Members
of the public will be al-
lowed to comment on the
draft before a final report
is released.
By then, it will have

been five years since the
collapse, which killed 98
people in Surfside on June
24, 2021, shaking the
small beach town and
raising existential ques-
tions about building safety
for high-rise dwellers
across the country.
Other investigations by

NIST — which has exam-
ined the causes of cata-
strophic building failures,
including at the World
Trade Center — have
taken between two-and-a-
half and six years to com-
plete.
Glenn Bell, who is co-

leading the Champlain
Towers investigation with
Mitrani-Reiser, called it
“one of the most complex
building-failure investiga-
tions ever undertaken.”
The agency assembled a

team of dozens of engi-
neers and other experts
tasked with conducting an
exhaustive review of the
collapse by testing materi-
als from the collapse site,
creating computer models
to simulate the event and,
after determining why the
building fell, making re-
commendations on how to

prevent similar catastro-
phes.
“We will continue to

work just as hard as we
can to ensure that we are
being thorough and that
our results are sound,”
Bell said, “so that we can
provide accurate and com-
plete answers to what
caused this tragedy and to
develop appropriate re-
commendations that will
make other buildings
safer.”
The team has already

tested more than 1,000
concrete and rebar sam-

ples taken from the col-
lapse site, officials said.
The materials are being
stored at two warehouses
in undisclosed locations.
NIST officials said last

week that they have begun
returning those samples to
the Miami-Dade Police
Department because they
are considered evidence in
a death investigation that
remains open.
In prior public updates,

investigators have said
there is “strong evidence”
that the collapse began in
the pool deck of the 12-
story, L-shaped Cham-
plain Towers South build-
ing, though they had not
yet ruled out that an initial
failure point “in some part
of the tower” could have
led to the collapse of the
deck.
A Miami Herald

investigation found the
pool deck collapsed sever-
al minutes before half of
the tower fell. In consulta-
tion with structural engi-
neers, the Herald identi-
fied major weaknesses in
the structure and other
problems that compound-
ed in the weeks before the
collapse. Those included
areas where the pool deck
appeared to be sagging

dangerously, cracking a
nearby planter.
The conclusions by

NIST will have implica-
tions for millions of high-
rise dwellers around the
world because the agency
is likely to recommend
changes to building codes
and construction practic-
es.
Legislation passed at the

county and state levels
since the collapse has
already had substantial
impacts on condo living in
South Florida. Inspection
requirements have been
tightened, and new rules
are forcing condo associ-
ations to maintain re-
serves for repairs.
Champlain Towers

South was undergoing a
critical, 40-year review
before it fell. After an
engineering firm high-
lighted “major structural
damage” and a “major
error” in the design of the
pool deck in 2018, repairs
were postponed amid
disputes over costs as unit
owners faced a $15 million
bill and massive individual
assessments.
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The site where the Champlain Towers South building partially collapsed on June 24, 2021, killing 98 people.
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A memorial near the site of the Champlain Towers South collapse, which killed 98 people in 2021.

‘‘WE DON’T NEED MORE HYPOTHESES.
WE NEED SOLID AND CONCRETE
ANSWERS. WE NEED ANSWERS NOW.
Pablo Langesfeld, whose daughter and son-in-law died
in the collapse


